GACMTRAEQUGICPASLWASLW._0046. XML

AMENDMENT IN THE NATURE OF A SUBSTITUTE

TO H.R. 3851

OFFERED BY MR, CARTER OF GEORGIA owd

Ms. Scharewsiag of Tlaas

Strike all after the enaeting clause and insert the

following:

1 SECTION1. SHORT TITLE.

2 This Act may be cited as the “Brand GSA Extension
3 Act”,

4 SEC, 2, THE CORPORATION FOR TRAVEL PROMOTION.

5 Subsection () of the Travel Promotion Act of 2009
6 (22 U.8.C.2181(h) is amended—

7 (1) in paragraph (2)(A)—

8 (A) in clanse (it), by inserting ‘“‘or
9 foodseiviee” after “restaurant”;
10 (B} in elanse (v), by inserting *, svch ag
11 onteloor 1'('3‘(2’.1‘(2__&1;‘i01’1” before the seimicolon 4t the
12 end; and
13 (C) in clange (viii), by inserting “‘commer-
14 elal or private’” before “passenger air sector’’;
15 (2) in paragraph (5){A)—

16 {A) in clause (i), by inserting “speaking
17 conventions, sales missions,” after “trade
18 shows,”;

GAVHLGM 11219\111219.226%m1  (74908513)

November 12, 2019 (5:30:p.m.}




GACMTEECV O\CPSLWISLW._0046, XML

£

Py

[ Sy

(B) in clduse (iv), by striking “and’” at the |
end;

(©) in clause (v), by striking the period at.
the end and nserting ; and”; and

(D) by adding at the end the following:

“.(vi.) to 1131*61‘1'1.0[:0 ) tourism to the.
United States-througly digital media, ouline
platforing, and other appropriate  me-

ditum.”’; and

J—

(3) in paragraph (7)(C), by striking “3. days”

—_
—_

and inserting “5 days”.
] 2 SEC. 3. ACCOUNTABILITY MEASURES.
13 Subscetion (¢) of the Travel Promotion Act of 2009

14 (22 U.8.€. 2131(c)) is amended—

15 (1) in paragraph (2), by striking “$500,000”
16 and inserting “$450,000”; and
17 (2) in paragraph (3)—
18 (A) by redesignating subparagraph (I) as
19 subparagraph (K);
20 (B) in subparagraph (I)(iil), by striking
21 “and” at the end; and
22 | (Y Dby inserting after subparagraph
23 (H) (ii1) the followinig:

GAVHLCIH12T9\ 11219.326xmi (749085(3)

November 12, 2078-(5:30 p.m.)




GACMTEVECY 6\CPASLWASLW_0046. XML

3

1 “(I) a list of counfries the Corporation
2 identifies as emerging markets for tourism to
3 the United States; |

4 “(J) a deseription of the efforts the Cor:
5 poration has made to promote tourism to rural
6 areas of the United States; and”.

7 SEC. 4. EXTENSION OF FUNDING FOR BRAND USA,

8 Subsection (d) of the Travel Promotion Act of 2009
9 (22 U.S.¢L 2131(d)) is amended
10 (1) m paragraph (2)(I13), by striking “202¢”
11 and inserting “2027”;

12 {2) In paragraph ('3'}(]33)’("11_), by striking “70
13 pereent” and inserting “50 percent”; and

14 (3) i paragraph (4)(B), by striking “2020™
15 and inserting “2027"..

16 SEC. 5. PERFORMANCE PLAN.

17 Not later than 90 days after the date of the enact-
18 nent of this Act, the Corporation for Travel Promotion
19 shall make the performanee metrics established pursnant
20 to subseetion (f)(1}{A) of the Travel Promotion Act of
21 2009 (22 U.8.C. 2131(0H{1)(A)) publicly available on the

22 website of the Corporation.

'Q:WH].-;__CH 121641 1"1_2_1_9.’__326,xr'n1' (74908513}
- November 12, 2019 (5:30 pm.)



GACMTEECM 6\CPASLWASLW_0046 XML

4
1 8EC. 6. ELECTRONIC SYSTEM FOR TRAVEL AUTHORIZA-
2 TION FEE INCREASE.
3 Section 217(hH3)YMB(ENI) of the Immigration and

4 Nationality Aet (3 U.S.C. 118T(W){3)(B)(1)(1}) is amended
5 by striking “$10” and inserting “$17”.

X

GAVHLCM11219V111219.326 %m (748085(3)
November 12, 2019 (5:30 p.m.}




