AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

116TH CONGRESS
nRE H, R, 3432

To amend title 49, United States Code, to improve the safety of the Nation’s
natural gas and hazardous liquid pipeline systems, and for other purposes.

M.

To

~N N O W

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

JUNE 24, 2019

Rush introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee
on Transportation and Infrastructure, and in addition to the Committee
on Energy and Commeree, for a period to be subsequently determined by
the Speaker, in each case for consideration of such provisions as fall with-
in the jurisdiction of the committee concerned

A BILL

amend title 49, United States Code, to improve the
safety of the Nation’s natural gas and hazardous liquid
pipeline systems, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHORT TITLE.—This Act may be cited as the
“Safer Pipelines Act of 2019”7,

(b) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table of contents for

this Act 1s as follows:

Sec. 1. Short title; table of contents.
See. 2. Authorization of appropriations.



O 0 9 N U BB WD =

[N I S e e e e e T e T T
S O o0 N N B BN WD = O

See.
See.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

See.

2

Purpose and general authority.

Risk analysis and integrity management programs.

Community right-to-know and emergency preparedness.

Actions by private persons.

Civil penalties.

Criminal penalties.

Direct hire authority for Pipeline and Hazardous Materials Safety Ad-
ministration.

10. Report.

e

SEC. 2. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.

(a) OPERATIONAL EXPENSES.—There are authorized

to be appropriated to the Secretary of Transportation for

the necessary operational expenses of the Pipeline and

Hazardous Materials Safety Administration the following

amounts:

(1) $24,215,000 for fiscal year 2020.
(2) $24,941,450 for fiscal year 2021.
(3) $26,460,000 for fiscal year 2022.
(4) $27,254,000 for fiscal year 2023.

(b) GAS AND HAZARDOUS  LIQUID.—Section

60125(a) of title 49, United States Code, is amended—

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking subparagraphs
(A) through (D) and inserting the following:

“(A) $160,800,000 for fiscal year 2020, of
which $10,000,000 shall be expended for car-
rying out such section 12 and $50,000,000
shall be expended for making grants;

“(B) $165,624,000 for fiscal year 2021 of
which $10,000,000 shall be expended for car-

*HR 3432 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

3
rying out such section 12 and $50,000,000

shall be expended for making grants;

“(C) $170,600,000 for fiscal year 2022, of
which $10,000,000 shall be expended for car-
rying out such section 12 and $50,000,000
shall be expended for making grants; and

“(D) $175,700,000 for fiscal year 2023, of
which $10,000,000 shall be expended for car-
rying out such section 12 and $50,885,000
shall be expended for making grants.”;

(2) in paragraph (2), by striking subparagraphs

(A) through (D) and inserting the following:

“(A) $25,000,000 for fiscal year 2020, of
which $5,000,000 shall be expended for car-
rying out such section 12 and $9,000,000 shall
be expended for making grants;

“(B) $25,000,000 for fiscal year 2021, of
which $5,000,000 shall be expended for car-
rying out such section 12 and $9,000,000 shall
be expended for making grants;

“(C) $26,000,000 for fiscal year 2022, of
which $5,000,000 shall be expended for car-
rying out such section 12 and $9,000,000 shall

be expended for making grants; and

*HR 3432 IH



O o0 N N Bk W =

O TN NG T N T NG N NG I NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG O N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) B ~SU O T NO I e

4
“(D) $26,000,000 for fiscal year 2023, of
which $5,000,000 shall be expended for car-
rying out such section 12 and $9,000,000 shall
be expended for making grants.”; and
(3) in paragraph (3), by striking “$8,000,000
for each of fiscal years 2017 through 2019 and in-
serting “$9,000,000 for each of fiscal years 2020
through 2023,

(¢)  EMERGENCY RESPONSE GRANTS.—Section

60125(b)(2) of title 49, United States Code, is amended
by striking “$10,000,000 for each of fiscal years 2012
through 2015 and inserting “$12,000,000 for each of fis-
cal years 2020 through 2023,

(d) PIPELINE SAFETY INFORMATION GRANTS TO

COMMUNITIES.—Section 60130(¢) of title 49, United
States Code, is amended by striking “section 2(b) of the
PIPES Act of 2016, the Secretary shall expend
$1,500,000 for each of fiscal years 2016 through 2019
to carry out this section. Such amounts shall not be de-
rived from user fees collected under section 603017 and
inserting “‘section 2(a) of the Safer Pipelines Act of 2019,
the Secretary shall expend $2,000,000 for each of fiscal
years 2020 through 2023 to carry out this section’.

(¢) STATE DAMAGE PREVENTION PROGRAMS.—Sec-

tion 60134(i) of title 49, United States Code is amended

*HR 3432 IH



O o0 N N W B W =

|\ I O B NG I NS R NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 NN O W BN~ WD = ©

5}
by striking “$1,500,000 for each of fiscal years 2012
through 2015”7 and inserting “$2,000,000 for each of fis-
cal years 2020 through 2023,

(f) ONE-CALL NOTIFICATION PROGRAMS.—Section
6107 of title 49, United States Code, is amended by strik-
ing “$1,058,000 for each of fiscal years 2016 through
20197 and inserting “$2,000,000 for each of fiscal years
2020 through 2023".

SEC. 3. PURPOSE AND GENERAL AUTHORITY.
(a) COST-BENEFIT ANALYSIS.—Section 60102(b) of
title 49, United States Code, is amended—

(1) in paragraph (2)—

(A) by striking subparagraphs (C) through
(E); and

(B) by redesignating subparagraphs (F)
and (G) as subparagraphs (C) and (D), respec-
tively; and
(2) by striking paragraphs (3) through (7).

(b) SAFETY  CONDITION  REPORTS.—Section
60102(h)(2) of title 49, United States Code, is amended
by striking ‘“State authorities’” and inserting ‘“‘State offi-
cials, including local emergency responders and appro-
priate on-scene coordinators for any applicable contin-

eency plans”.

*HR 3432 IH



[E—

6
SEC. 4. RISK ANALYSIS AND INTEGRITY MANAGEMENT

PROGRAMS.
(a) DIRECT ASSESSMENTS.—Section 60109(¢) of
title 49, United States Code, is amended by adding at the

end the following:

O o0 9 N W B~ W

[\ TR N© I N R NG T NG I N T NS R S e e T e e e T e T
A N R~ WD = O 0O 00NN B WD - O

“(12) USE OF DIRECT ASSESSMENTS.—

“(A) TRANSMISSION PIPELINE FACILITIES
REGULATION.—Not later than 2 years after the
date of enactment of this paragraph, the Sec-
retary shall issue regulations for methods of as-
sessment  of  transmission pipeline facilities
under paragraph (3) that prioritize methods
that would provide a greater level of safety than
direct assessment, including the use of internal
mspection devices or pressure testing.

“(B) DISTRIBUTION PIPELINES STUDY.—
Not later than 2 years after the date of enact-
ment of this paragraph, the Secretary shall sub-
mit to the Committees on Energy and Com-
merce and Transportation and Infrastructure of
the House of Representatives and the Com-
mittee on Commerce, Science, and Transpor-
tation of the Senate a report containing—

“(1) the results of a study of methods
of assessment of distribution pipelines that

may be used under paragraph (3), other

*HR 3432 IH



7

1 than direct assessment, to determine

2 whether any such methods—

3 “(I) would provide an equal or

4 oreater level of safety than direct as-

5 sessment of such pipelines; and

6 “(II) are feasible; and

7 “(11) any recommendations based on

8 such study.”.

9 (b) AUTOMATIC OR REMOTE SHUTOFF VALVES.—
10 Section 60109 of title 49, United States Code, is amended
11 by adding at the end the following:

12 “(h) AUTOMATIC OR REMOTE SHUTOFF VALVES FOR

13 TRANSMISSION PIPELINE FACILITIES.

14 “(1) REQUIREMENT.—

15 “(A) IN GENERAL.—Except as provided in
16 paragraph (2), beginning on the date that is 2
17 yvears after the date of enactment of this sub-
18 section, each operator of a transmission pipeline
19 facility that is located in a high consequence
20 area (as defined in subsection (g)) shall, based
21 on a risk assessment, install for the trans-
22 mission pipeline facility automatic or remote
23 shutoff valves, as appropriate.

24 “(B) INSPECTION AND ENFORCEMENT.—
25 The Secretary shall conduct inspections under

*HR 3432 IH



8

1 section 60117(c) to determine whether each op-
2 erator of a transmission pipeline facility to
3 which this paragraph applies is complying with
4 this section.

5 “(2) EXCEPTION.—If the Secretary requires by
6 regulation, under section 60102(n), the use of auto-
7 matic or remote-controlled shut-off valves, or equiva-
8 lent technology, on a transmission pipeline facility,
9 paragraph (1) shall not apply to the transmission
10 pipeline facility.”.
11 SEC. 5. COMMUNITY RIGHT-TO-KNOW AND EMERGENCY
12 PREPAREDNESS.
13 (a) IN GENERAL.—Section 60116 of title 49, United

14 States Code, 1s amended to read as follows:

15 “§60116. Community right-to-know and emergency

16 preparedness

17 “(a) PuBLIC EDUCATION PROGRAMS.

18 “(1) IN GENERAL.—Each owner or operator of
19 a gas or hazardous liquid pipeline facility shall carry
20 out a continuing program to educate the public on—
21 “(A) the use of a one-call notification sys-
22 tem prior to excavation and other damage pre-
23 vention activities;

*HR 3432 IH



O o0 N N W Bk W =

[\O N O B i e e e e e e e T
—_— O O o0 N N O nm R~ WD = O

22
23
24
25

9

“(B) the possible hazards associated with
unintended releases from the pipeline facility;
and

“(C) the physical indications that a release
from a pipeline facility may have occurred, the
steps that should be taken for public safety in
the event of such a release, and how to report
such a release.

“(2) REVIEW AND MODIFICATION OF EXISTING

PROGRAMS.—Not later than 1 year after the date of

enactment of the Safer Pipelines Act of 2019, each
owner or operator of a gas or hazardous liquid pipe-
line facility shall—

“(A) review its existing public education
program for effectiveness, and modify the pro-
oram as necessary; and

“(B) submit to the Secretary for review a
detailed deseription of its public education pro-
oram, including any modifications made to the
program under subparagraph (A).

“(3) STANDARDS; MATERIAL.—The Secretary
may—

“(A) issue standards for public education
programs under this section, including stand-

ards providing for periodic review of such pro-

*HR 3432 IH



O o0 9 N U B W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

10

orams and modification of such programs as

needed; and

“(B) develop material for use in the pro-
oTams.

“(b) L1AISON WITH STATE AND LOCAL EMERGENCY
RESPONSE ENTITIES.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 1 year after
the date of enactment of the Safer Pipelines Act of
2019, an operator of a gas or hazardous liquid pipe-
line facility shall establish liaison with—

“(A) the State emergency response com-
mission established under section 301 of the
Emergency Planning and Community Right-To-
Know Act of 1986 in each State in which the
pipeline facility operates; and

“(B) the local emergency planning com-
mittee established under such section in each
emergency planning district in which the pipe-
line facility operates.

“(2) AVAILABILITY OF INFORMATION.—Upon
request, an operator of a gas or hazardous liquid
pipeline facility shall make available to the applica-
ble State emergency response commissions and local

emergency planning committees—

*HR 3432 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

T e N T
~N O L B WY = O

18
19
20
21
22
23

11

“(A) the information required to be main-
tained under section 60102(d);

“(B) a copy of any integrity management
program adopted by the operator under section
60109; and

“(C) information describing the implemen-
tation of the integrity management program
and the risks that the program is designed to
address.

“(3) COMMUNITIES WITHOUT LOCAL EMER-

GENCY PLANNING COMMITTEES.

In a community
for which a local emergency planning committee has
not been established, the operator of a gas or haz-
ardous liquid pipeline facility shall liaise with the
local fire, police, and other emergency response enti-

ties.

“(¢) PUBLIC AVAILABILITY OF REPORTS.—The Sec-

retary shall make available to the public—

“(1) any safety-related condition report sub-
mitted by an operator under section 60102(h); and

“(2) a report of a pipeline incident filed by an
operator pursuant to this chapter.

“(d) ACCESS TO INTEGRITY MANAGEMENT PROGRAM

24 INFORMATION.—The Secretary shall prescribe require-

25

ments for public access to information regarding integrity

*HR 3432 IH



O© o0 3 O WD B W N e

[\© TN NG I N T NG N NG I NS B e T e e T e T e e T
[ B N O N N = = N e RN - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O I NO S e

12
management programs provided to a State authority pur-
suant to section 60109(¢)(9)(C).

“(e) AVAILABILITY OF MAPS.—The owner or oper-

ator of each interstate gas pipeline facility and interstate
hazardous liquid pipeline facility shall—

“(1) not later than 1 year after the date of en-
actment of this subsection, provide to each munici-
pality in which the pipeline facility is located a map
identifying the location of such faecility; and

“(2) provide to each such municipality an up-
dated map not later than 6 months after any change
to a location of such facility.

“(f) PIPELINE SEGMENT REPORTS.

“(1) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 6 months
after the date of enactment of the Safer Pipelines
Act of 2019, and not less frequently than annually
thereafter, each owner or operator of a gas or haz-
ardous liquid pipeline facility shall submit to the
Secretary a report on pipeline segments of the facil-
ity in accordance with this subsection.

“(2) CONTENTS OF REPORTS.—The owner or

operator of a pipeline facility submitting a report
under paragraph (1) shall include in the report the
following information for each pipeline segment of

the facility:

*HR 3432 IH



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

13

“(A) The business name, address, and tele-
phone number of the owner or operator.

“(B) A summary description of the pipe-
line facility containing the pipeline segment, in-
cluding a general facility map and a deseription
of any product the pipeline facility transports,
the length of the facility, and origin and termi-
nation points.

“(C) State and local emergency response
liaison information.

“(D) A description of periodic testing
methods used on the pipeline segment and the
frequency of such testing.

“(E) A summary of the results of periodic
testing of the pipeline segment pursuant to sec-
tion 60102, including any defects detected and
actions taken to address the defects.

“(F) A description of the leak detection
system 1n use on the pipeline segment and its
sensitivity.

“(G) A bH-year incident history for the
pipeline segment.

“(H) An inspection and enforcement his-

tory for the pipeline segment.

*HR 3432 IH



O o0 N N n B W =

[\© TN NG I N T NG N NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
[ N N O N N = = N R - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O B NO R e

14
“(I) It applicable, a summary of integrity
management program activities under section

60109(c)(3) related to the pipeline segment.

“(3) AUTHORITY OF SECRETARY.—The Sec-
retary may modify or waive any of the information
required to be included in a report under paragraph
(2) for a pipeline facility if the Secretary determines
that the inclusion of such information would pose a
risk to the security of the pipeline facility.

“(4) AVAILABILITY OF REPORTS.—The Seec-
retary shall make each report submitted under para-
oraph (1) available to the public electronically.

“(5) PIPELINE SEGMENT DEFINED.—In this
subsection, the term ‘pipeline segment’ means—

“(A) with respect to a gas pipeline facil-
ity—

“(1) the length of pipeline between the
origin and the first compressor station;

“(i1) each length of pipeline between
intermittent compressor stations; and

“(i11) the length of pipeline between
the final compressor station and the termi-
nation point; and
“(B) with respect to a hazardous liquid

pipeline facility—

*HR 3432 IH



O o0 N N B W =

[
@)

11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

15
“(i) the length of pipeline between the
origin and the first pumping station;
“(i1) each length of pipeline between
intermittent pumping stations; and
“(i11) the length of pipeline between
the final pumping station and the termi-
nation point.”.
(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—The analysis for
chapter 601 i1s amended by striking the item relating to

section 60116 and inserting the following:

“60116. Community right-to-know and emergency preparedness.”.
SEC. 6. ACTIONS BY PRIVATE PERSONS.
Section 60121 of title 49, United States Code, is

amended by adding at the end the following:

“(e) MANDAMUS.—A person may bring a civil action
in an appropriate district court of the United States to
compel the Secretary to perform a nondiscretionary duty
under this chapter that the Secretary has failed to per-
form.”".
SEC. 7. CIVIL PENALTIES.

Section 60122(a) of title 49, United States Code, is
amended—

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “The max-
imum civil penalty under this paragraph for a re-

lated series of violations is $2,000,000.”;

*HR 3432 IH



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

16
(2) in paragraph (2), by striking “$50,000”
and inserting “$200,000”; and
(3) in paragraph (3), by striking “$1,000” and
inserting “$200,000".
SEC. 8. CRIMINAL PENALTIES.

Section 60123 of title 49, United States Code, is
amended by striking “knowingly and willfully”” each place
it appears and inserting “‘knowingly or recklessly”’.

SEC. 9. DIRECT HIRE AUTHORITY FOR PIPELINE AND HAZ-
ARDOUS MATERIALS SAFETY ADMINISTRA-
TION.

(a) AuTHORITY.—The Administrator of the Pipeline
and Hazardous Materials Safety Administration may ap-
point qualified candidates to positions described in sub-
section (b) without regard to sections 3309 through 3319
of title 5, United States Code.

(b) APPLICABILITY.—The authority under subsection
(a) applies with respect to candidates for any position that
would likely allow increased activities relating to pipeline
safety, as determined by the Administrator.

(¢) TERMINATION.—The authority to make appoint-
ments under this section shall not be available after Sep-

tember 30, 2024.

*HR 3432 IH



o N9 N e B W

17
SEC. 10. REPORT.

Not later than 180 days after the date of enactment
of this Act, and annually thereafter through calendar year
2023, the Administrator of the Pipeline and Hazardous
Materials Safety Administration shall submit to Congress
a report on the efforts of the Administration to hire

women, minorities, and veterans as inspectors since Janu-

ary 1, 2012.

*HR 3432 IH




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2019-07-03T00:34:47-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




